Whitehead, LaDawn

From: Dan Czuba [dan@alliancecontracting.org]

Sent: Thursday, March 07, 2013 8:54 AM

To: Cahn, Jeffrey

Cc: Blake, Leslie; Whitehead, LaDawn

Subject: RE: TSCA-0502012-0021 BD2751267X022 NOTICE OF PAYMENT
Attachments: CCF03072013_00000.jpg

You guys made me a celebrity; everyone is asking me about our EPA fine. Anyway, the check is in today’s mail.

Sincerely,

Daniel G. Czuba

owner/designer D E @
www.alliancecontracting.org {n E @ W E

989.450.2800 cell
989.894.8736 fax
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From: Cahn. Jeff@epamail.epa.qov [mailto:Cahn.Jeff@epamail.epa.qov]
Sent: Monday, December 03, 2012 12:00 PM

To: Dan Czuba , _

Cc: Blake.Leslie@epamail.epa.gov; Whitehead. L.adawn@epamail.epa.gov
Subject: Re: TSCA-0502012-0021 BD2751267X022 NOTICE OF PAYMENT

1 am copying LaDawn Whitehead, the Regional Hearing Clerk, on this response. Thank you for your notice of payment.

Jeffrey A, Cahn, Associate Regional Counsel
Office of Regicnal Counsel (Mail Code C-14J)
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency

77 West Jackson Bivd.

Chicago, lllinois 60604

PH: 312-386-6670

FAX: 312-692-2971

email: cahn jeff@epa.gov

CONFIDENTIAL: This message may contain information that is privileged or otherwise exempt from disclosure under
applicable law. Do not disclose without consulting the Office of Regional Counsel. If you think that you received this email
in error, then please notify the sender immediately.

“"Dan Czuba" ---12/03/2012 10:57.37 AM---1 have mailed out the first $500 payment, and am sending this NOTICE OF
PAYMENT. Does anyone have th '

From: "Dan Czuba" <dan@alliancecontraciing.org>

To: Leslie Blake/RS/USEPAMIS@EPA, Jeff Cahn/RE/USEPAIUS@EPA,
Date: 12/03/2012 10:57 AM

Subject: TSCA-0502012-0021 BD2751267X022 NOTICE OF PAYMENT




I have mailed out the first $500 payment, and am sending this NOTICE OF PAYMENT. Does anyone have the Regional Hearing Clerk
{E-19)} email, so | can send that also? | would prefer to send via email, so you get it right away. This is my first time doing anything
like this, so please bear with me. | am going to try and pay it off quicker, because this is a lot to go through just to make a payment.

Sincerely,

Daniel G. Czuba

owner/designer

www.alllancecontracting.org
989,450.2800 cell
989.894,8736 fax




